Bid Summary Sheet

Const. of Pickleball Courts Hinding Tennis, LLC Old Colony Construction LLC McCarthy Concrete, Inc.
Indian River Rec Complex 57 East Industrial aRoad 10 Bluff Avenue, Unit121 30 Talbot Lane
Bid Date: February 14, 2024 Branford, CT 06405 Clinton, CT 06413 South Windsor, CT 06074
Unit Unit Unit
No. ltem Quant | unit Price Total Price Total Price Total
1 |[Sedimentation & Erosion Control Lump Sum $ 2,500.00 $ 7,339.00 N Bid
2 |Remove BB Standards Lump Sum $ 997.00 $ 4,897.00 No Bid
3 |Relocate Ex. Light Poles & Fixtures Lump Sum $ 12,000.00 $ 25,824.00 No Bid
4 |Remove Ex. Block Retaining Wall Lump Sum $ 2,800.00 $ 5,832.00 No Bid
4 [Sawcut Ex. Bit. Concrete Pavement 60 LF |[$ 400.00| $ 2,400.00 | ¢ 19.00 | $ 1,140.00 No Bid
5  |Unclassified Excavation 135 cy |$ 80.00|$ 10,800.00 [ 115.00 | $ 15,525.00 No Bid
6 |Rock Excavation 20 CY [$  200.000|$ 4,000.00 | ¢ 233.00|$ 4,660.00 No Bid
7 |Pavement Removal 6,500 SF |[$ 150|$%$ 9,750.00 | $ 3.00|$ 19,500.00 | $ 1.27 1% 8,255.00
8 |F & P 3/4" Broken Stone Base 120 CYy |$ 80.00|$ 9,600.00 |$ 98.00 | $ 11,760.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 10,800.00
9 |F & P Bituminouc Concrete Bsse 6,500 SF [$ 200|% 13,000.00 |$ 2.00|% 13,000.00 ($ 2.88|% 18,720.00
10 |F & P Bituminous Concrete Surface 6,500 SF [$ 200|% 13,000.00 |$ 2.00|$% 13,000.00($ 2.88|% 18,720.00
11 |F & 110" High Black VCCL Fence 316 LF |$ 70.00|$ 22,120.00 |$ 90.00 | $ 28,440.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 37,920.00
12 |Acrylic Color System 6,016 SF |[$ 4841% 29,117.44 1% 3.80(% 2,860.80 | $ 5.00 | $ 30,080.00
13 |Pickleball Net and Posts 3 Sets |$ 2,900.00 | $ 8,700.00 |$ 6,370.00 | $ 19,110.00 | $ 4,430.00 | $ 13,290.00
14 Remove Ex. C.L. Fence 175 LF |$ 10.00( $ 1,750.00 | $ 29.00( $ 5,075.00| $ 63.00| $ 11,025.00
Total $ 142,591.44 $ 177,962.80 $ 200,086.00
ALTERNATE BID ITEM
A-1 [Const. Post Tensioned Conc. Courts 6,016|sf $ 1650 | $ 99,264.00 [ $ 20.00|$ 120,320.00 | $ 1454|% 8,747,264.00
Red Numbers are corrected Totals
Highlighted Bid incomplete -Unacceptable
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